

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 25, 2020
CORRUGATED METAL BRIDGE FLOORING / BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BEAMS
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

The Ohio Bridge Corporation DBA U.S. Bridge
 201 Wheeling Avenue, P.O. Box 757
 Cambridge, OH 43725
 (740) 421-9336

Bid Bond: Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America - 6%

Delivery: As needed based on Mill Rollings

Corrugated Metal Bridge Flooring - Approx. 3,000 Sq. Ft.

Panel Gauge	Corrugation	Width	Price Bid (Per Sq. Ft.)
3	3" x 9"	18"	21.00
3	3" x 9"	24"	No Bid
5	3" x 9"	18"	19.00
5	3" x 9"	24"	No Bid
7	2" x 6"	18"	No Bid
7	2" x 6"	24"	No Bid
7	3" x 9"	18"	No Bid
7	3" x 9"	24"	No Bid

Bridge Replacement Beams - Approx. 5,000 Lbs.

	Price Bid (Per Lb.)
Steel Beams	1.59
Galvanizing	0.28

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 25, 2020
STORM SEWER PIPE
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

		Chemung Supply Corp. P.O. Box 527 Elmira, NY 14802 (607) 733-6506 <small>Bid Bond: Fidelity and Deposit Company of Maryland - 8%</small> DELIVERY: within terms				Pipelines Inc. P.O. Box 2027 16363 St. Clair Ave. East Liverpool, OH 43920 (234) 567-1388 <small>Bid Bond: Federal Insurance Company - 8%</small> DELIVERY: Call for delivery				Marlboro Supply (Michael Lins) 9271 Edison Street Louisville, OH 44641 (330) 935-0179 <small>Bid Bond: Official Check - \$6,000.00</small> DELIVERY: Pickup or Delivery				Core and Main, LP 320 Tallmadge Road Kent, OH 44340 (330) 673-4296 <small>Bid Bond: Federal Insurance Company - 8%</small> DELIVERY: 1 to 8 days ARO				Winsupply of Cleveland 4547 Hinckley Industrial Pkwy Cleveland, OH 44109 (724) 622-6066 <small>Bid Bond: Western Surety Company - 8%</small> DELIVERY: 1 to 2 weeks must order truckload quantities			
Corrugated Metal Pipe (CMP)/ Aluminized Steel Pipe (AS)	CMP (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	AS (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	CMP (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	AS (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	CMP (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	AS (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	CMP (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	AS (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	CMP (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	AS (Per Ft.)	Bands (Each)	
2,000 L.F. 12", 16 Ga.	9.20	9.20	9.75	9.75	10.00	12.00	10.63	12.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	9.10	9.10	9.65	9.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
1,000 L.F. 15", 16 Ga.	11.00	11.00	11.75	11.75	12.00	14.40	12.75	15.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	10.90	10.90	11.60	11.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
500 L.F. 18", 16 Ga.	13.95	13.95	14.75	14.75	15.00	18.00	15.94	19.13	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	13.65	13.65	14.50	14.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
500 L.F. 21", 14 Ga.	18.25	18.25	19.25	19.25	19.69	23.83	20.74	24.89	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	17.90	17.90	18.65	18.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
500 L.F. 24", 14 Ga.	20.85	20.85	22.00	22.00	22.50	27.00	23.70	28.44	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	20.45	20.45	21.55	21.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
500 L.F. 30", 14 Ga.	26.10	20.10	27.50	27.50	28.13	33.75	29.63	35.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	25.60	25.60	26.95	26.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
300 L.F. 36", 12 Ga.	40.95	40.95	43.75	43.75	44.10	52.92	47.16	56.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	40.10	40.40	42.90	42.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
300 L.F. 48", 12 Ga.	54.25	54.25	58.00	58.00	58.50	70.20	62.58	75.08	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	53.20	53.20	56.90	56.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Plastic Pipe (PP)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	PP (Per Ft.)	Bands/Connectors (Each)	
1,000 L.F. 12"	4.19	6.85	4.40	7.19	4.19	6.85	4.30	5.05	4.19	6.85											
1,000 L.F. 15"	5.45	11.35	5.72	11.92	5.45	9.66	5.60	11.90	5.45	11.35											
500 L.F. 18"	8.17	19.35	8.58	20.32	8.17	19.35	8.35	14.35	8.17	19.35											
500 L.F. 24"	13.56	27.29	14.24	28.65	13.56	27.29	13.85	20.25	13.56	27.29											
500 L.F. 30"	20.39	63.82	21.41	67.01	20.39	63.82	20.80	60.00	20.39	63.82											
500 L.F. 36"	24.65	90.25	25.88	94.76	24.65	90.25	25.15	65.45	24.65	90.25											
500 L.F. 42"	32.26	131.17	33.88	137.73	32.26	131.17	32.90	100.70	32.26	131.17											
500 L.F. 48"	41.83	153.63	43.92	161.31	41.83	153.63	42.70	112.45	41.83	153.63											
500 L.F. 54"	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID											
500 L.F. 60"	73.58	238.87	77.26	250.81	73.58	238.87	75.10	249.90	73.58	238.87											

**TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 25, 2020
 GUARD RAIL
 PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO**

			Firelands Supply Co. 18 South Norwalk Road P.O. Box 828 Norwalk, OH 44857 (419) 668-1802 Bid Bond: Cashier's Check - \$2,280.50		Chemung Supply Corp. P.O. Box 527 Elmira, NY 14902 (607) 733-5506 Bid Bond: Fidelity and Deposit Company of Maryland - 6%	
			Price Bid	Total	Price Bid	Total
Quantity	Unit of Measure	Description				
3,000	L.F.	12 Gauge Galvanized Guard Rail	10.45	31,350.00	11.50	34,500.00
60	Each	Curved End Treatments - Convex	90.50	5,430.00	109.00	6,540.00
60	Each	Curved End Treatments - Concave	90.50	5,430.00	109.00	6,540.00
100	Each	Half Wraps	34.00	3,400.00	38.00	3,800.00
		TOTAL		\$ 45,610.00		\$ 51,380.00