

TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 25, 2020 - BITUMINOUS MATERIALS
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

			Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corporation, Inc. 8920 Canyon Falls Blvd., Suite 120 Twinsburg, OH 44087 (330) 425-3270	Central Allied Enterprises, Inc. P.O. Box 80449 Canton, OH 44708-0449 (330) 477-6751	D & R Supply, Inc. 18228 Fulton Road Marshallville, OH 44845 (330) 856-3781	HEI-WAY, LLC 290 North Pike Road Sarver, PA 16055 (724) 353-2700	Cuyahoga Asphalt Materials LLC. P.O. Box 107 Fredericktown, OH 43019 (740) 848-4918	The Arms Trucking Co. P.O. Box 369 14818 Mayfield Road E. Claridon, OH 44033 (800) 352-1343	Kokosing Materials, Inc. P.O. Box 334 Fredericktown, OH 43019 (740) 848-4918	
			Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual Insurance Company - 5%	Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual Insurance Company - 8%	Bid Bond: Travelers Casualty & Surety Company of America - 5%	Bid Bond: Cashier's Check #2013665948 - \$1,000.00	Bid Bond: Erie Insurance Company - 5%	Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual Insurance Company - 5%	Bid Bond: Old Republic Surety Company - 5%	Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual Insurance Company - 5%
			Plant Location: 1234 Boel Drive - Kent, OH 44240 No Exceptions	Plant Location: 8605 ST. RT. 14 - Streetsboro, OH 44241 No Exceptions	Plant Location: 3015 Columbus Road, N.E. - Canton, Ohio 44705 No Exceptions	Plant Location: 18228 Fulton Road - Marshallville, Ohio PRICES QUOTED ARE CURRENT BOARD PRICES AND ARE NOT GUARANTEED DUE TO FLUCTUATION IN THE EVER-CHANGING OIL MARKET	Plant Location: 290 North Pike Road - Sarver, PA 16055	Plant Location: 3486 Frost Road - Mantua, Ohio 44255	Plant Location: Newbury, Ohio	Plant Location: 741 Tallmadge Road - Kent, OH 44240
Quantity	Unit of Measure	Description	Price Bid (Per Ton)	Price Bid (Per Ton)	Price Bid (Per Ton)	Price Bid (Per Ton)	Price Bid (Per Ton)	Price Bid (Per Ton)	Price Bid (Per Ton)	
5,000	Tons	Delivered to 5000 Newton Falls Rd. Ravenna, OH 44266	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	99.00 ***	95.00	NO BID	95.00
5,000	Tons	SS-921 Cold Mix	NO BID	NO BID	125.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5,000	Tons	JASA HP Cold Patch			115.00					
5,000	Tons	405 Cold Mix	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	85.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4,000	Tons	#9 Stone Cold Patch	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	95.00	115.00	95.00
5,000	Tons	301 Modified	50.50	48.00	45.00	72.00	NO BID	49.75	NO BID	49.75
7,000	Tons	441PG 64-22 Type II	51.50	50.75	49.00	75.00	NO BID	50.75	NO BID	50.75
						NOTE: #402				
8,000	Tons	441PG 64-22 Type I	60.50	59.50	54.00	75.00	NO BID	60.00	NO BID	60.00
						NOTE: #404				

*** Hei-Way Premium Cold Mix at ODOT Contract No. 1016-16 (\$99/ton Delivered)

**TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 25, 2020 - BITUMINOUS LIQUIDS
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO**

Russell Standard Corporation
990 Hazel Street
Akron, OH 44306
(330) 733-9400

Bid Bond: Western Surety Company - 5%

Plant Location: Akron, Ohio
Demurrage Charges: \$95.00/Hour After Two (2) Free Hours
Demurrage Charges only apply to CRS-2, CRS-2P, RS2 & HFRS2P
Delivery Information: N/A

Quantity	Unit of Measure	Description	Price Bid (Per Gallon)
10,000	Gallons	CRS-2, FOB PLANT	1.88
50,000	Gallons	CRS-2, DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS	1.97
15,000	Gallons	CRS-2P, FOB Plant	2.15
50,000	Gallons	CRS-2P, DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS	2.24
50,000	Gallons	HFRS2P POLYMER MODIFIED ASPHALT EMULSION, DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS	2.24
15,000	Gallons	HFRS2P POLYMER MODIFIED ASPHALT EMULSION, FOB PLANT	2.15
50,000	Gallons	RS2, DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS	1.97
10,000	Gallons	RS2, FOB PLANT	1.88
10,000	Gallons	MC 30, FOB PLANT	3.55
10,000	Gallons	MC 70, FOB PLANT	3.40