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1A     So. Rock Salt $/Ton 25/Ton Truck Load 90 Truck loads

Morton $128.55 $3,213.75 $289,237.50

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded No Bid

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

2.    Chloine (150lb cyl) $ per 150 lb Cyl $ per 150 lb Cyl 16 Cyl

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones $60.00 $60.00 $960.00 $60.00/Cyl

Bonded $69.00 $69.00 $1,104.00 $100 cyl refund deposit

Barber $96.00 $96.00 $1,536.00 $100 cyl refund deposit

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

3.   Hydrofluosilicic $ per 30 gal drum $ per 30 gal Drum 100 drums

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $71.30 $71.30 $7,130.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $74.70 $74.70 $7,470.00 $35 refund deposit

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid  

4A.   Sod. Hypo Shalerville Bulk $ per 2000 gal $ per 2000 gal 13 deliveries Year end top off

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $1,880.00 $1,880.00 $24,440.00 $ .94/Gallon

JCI Jones $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $19,500.00 $ .75/Gallon

Bonded $1,918.00 $1,918.00 $24,934.00 $.959/Gallon

Barber $2,780.00 $2,780.00 $36,140.00 $1.39/Gallon

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

4B. Sod. Hypo (Riv. & Rand) $/15 gal carboy $/15gal carboy 35 Carboys

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $27.50 $27.50 $962.50

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $27.30 $27.30 $955.50 $35 refund deposit    $1.82/Gallon

Barber $40.05 $40.05 $1,401.75 $25 refund deposit 

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

$/30 gal drum $/30 gal drum 20 drums 10 drums each at Rand and FH WWTP

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $169.83 $169.83 $3,396.60

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $166.50 $166.50 $3,330.00 $35 refund deposit

Barber No Bid

Shannon $174.74 $174.74 $3,494.80

Chemrite No Bid

6. Potassium Perm $/50 lb Keg $/50 lb Keg 100 kegs

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $95.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $1.90/LB

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $83.50 $83.50 $8,350.00 36 Kegs/Full pallet Min. Delivey  $1.67/LB

Barber $159.99 $159.99 $15,999.00

Shannon $96.49 $96.49 $9,649.00

Chemrite $87.85 $87.85 $8,785.00

7.  Sod. Bisulfite 38% (Sh-ville) $/15gal carboy $/15gal carboy 70 Carboys

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $35.25 $35.25 $2,467.50

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $31.50 $31.50 $2,205.00  150 LB  $35 drum refund dep  $.21/LB

Barber $34.65 $34.65 $2,425.50 $25 drum refund dep 

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid
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8.  Sod. Bisulfite 38% (O&M) $/45lb Pail $/45lb Pail 15 Pails

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $119.70 $119.70 $1,795.50 45 LB Pail $2.66/LB

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $116.10 $116.10 $1,741.50 45 LB Pail $2.58/LB

Barber $149.00 $149.00 $2,235.00 45 LB Pail $3.31/LB

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite $116.50 $116.50 $1,747.50 6 Pail Minimum Order

9A. 38%  Ferric Chloride St-boro/FH $ per 4000 gal $ per 4000 gal 22 deliveries

Morton No Bid

5.  Citric Acid 50% - Randolph/FH WWTP
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SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $5,121.64 $5,121.64 $112,676.08 $586.00/Dry Ton  38% 4,000 Gal Bulk Delivery

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

9B. 38%  Ferric Chloride 2/3 PLTS $ per 4000 gal $ per 4000 gal 3 deliveries

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $5,121.64 $5,121.64 $15,364.92 $586.00/Dry Ton  38% 4,000 Gal Bulk Delivery

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

9B-1 Bolingbrook

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $5,296.44 $5,296.44 $5,296.44 $606/Dry Ton 38% 4,000 Gal Bulk Delivery 2 stops.

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

9B-2 Red Fox

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $5,296.44 $5,296.44 $5,296.44 $606/Dry Ton 38% 4,000 Gal Bulk Delivery 2 stops.

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

9B-3 Atwater Price/LB 13 Drums 13 Drums

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded No Bid

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

9C 38% Ferric 55 Gal Drum Price Each 13 durms

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $117.48 $117.48 $1,527.24 38% Ferric $.202/LB

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $116.00 $116.00 $1,508.00 $50 Dep. Per 55gal/drum 38% Ferric $.20/LB

Barber $117.15 $117.15 $1,522.95 $50 Dep. Per 55gal/drum 38% Ferric $.202/LB

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

10.     Calc Hypo pwr. Price Each $ per 100lb drum 30 drums

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $155.55 $155.55 $4,666.50

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $154.50 $154.50 $4,635.00

Barber $239.00 $239.00 $7,170.00

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite $153.00 $153.00 $4,590.00 6 Pail Minimum Order
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11A. 25%  Sodium Hydrox Shalerville $ per 2000 gal $ per 2000 gal 34 deliveries

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $1,617.20 $1,617.20 $54,984.80 25% NAOH Potable Water Grade $.808/Gallon

JCI Jones $1,760.00 $1,760.00 $59,840.00 25% NAOH Potable Water Grade $.88/Gallon

Bonded $2,900.00 $2,900.00 $98,600.00 25% NAOH Potable Water Grade $1.45/Gallon

Barber $2,450.00 $2,450.00 $83,300.00 25% NAOH Potable Water Grade $1.225/Gallon

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

11B 25%  Sodium Hydrox O&M $/15 gal carboy 15/15gal carboys

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $24.50 $24.50 $367.50

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $22.40 $22.40 $336.00 $35 refund deposit $.14/LB

Barber $45.00 $45.00 $675.00 $25 refund deposit

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid

12.   Ortho Phosphate Sh-ville/Br-field $ per 30 gal drum $ per 30 gal drum 60 drums 40 drums Shalesrville

20 drums Brimfield

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne No Bid

Sal $181.50 $181.50 $7,260.00 Combined = $10,890.00

Sal $181.50 $181.50 $3,630.00

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded $143.70 $143.70 $5,748.00 Combined = $8,622.00

Bonded $143.70 $143.70 $2,874.00

Barber No Bid

Shannon $142.42 $142.42 $5,696.80 Combined = $8,545.20

Shannon $142.42 $142.42 $2,848.40

Chemrite No Bid

13. Polymer 45% Blend Streetsboro $ per 2300lb tote $ per 2300lb tote 22 totes

Centrifuge and Belt Press

Morton No Bid

SNF Polydyne $2,875.00 $2,875.00 $63,250.00 Clarifloc CE-6242 Polymer 45% Blend

Sal No Bid

JCI Jones No Bid

Bonded No Bid

Barber No Bid

Shannon No Bid

Chemrite No Bid


