PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

TABULATION OF BIDS - APRIL 3, 2019

GUARD RAIL

Firelands Supply Co.
18 South Norwalk Road
Norwalk, OH 44857
(419) 668-1802

Chemung Supply Corp.
P.O. Box 527
Elmira, NY 14902
(607) 733-5506

Bid Bond: Cashier's Check - $2,789.50

Bid Bond: Fldelity and Deposit Company of

Maryland - §%
Quantity Unit of Measure |Description Price Bid Total Price Bid Total
3,000 L.F. 12 Gauge Galvanized Guard Rail 12.85 38,550.00 10.95 32,850.00
60 Each Curved End Treatments - Convex 112.00 6,720.00 95.00 5,700.00
60 Each Curved End Treatments - Concave 112.00 6,720.00 95.00 5,700.00
100 Each Half Wraps 38.00 3,800.00 32.00 3,200.00
TOTAL $ 55,790.00 $ 47,450.00




TABULATION OF BIDS - APRIL 3, 2019

STORM SEWER PIPE

PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

Chemung Supply Corp. Core and Main, LP Marlboro Supply (Michaet Lins) |
P.0. Box 827 320 Talmadge Road 9271 Edison Strest
Elnira, NY 14902 Kent, OH 44240 Loulsville, OH 44641
{607) 733-5506 (330) 6734298 {330) 935-017%
Bid Bond: Fidality and Deposk Company of Marylend - #% Bid Bond: Federal Ineurance Company - #% Bid Bond: Erle lnaurance Company - 8% ]
DEUVERY; 2403 deys ARD DELIVERY: 1 10 2 wwela DELVERY: Pictaup or Culvery
gated Metal Pipe (CMPY CMP Bands AS Bands cmp Bands AS Bands cMp Bands AS Bands
Aluminized Steel Pips (AS) (Per F1) (Each) (Per Ft) (Each) (Per F1) (Each) (Per Ft) {Each) (Per Ft) (Each) (Per F1) {Each)
2,000 LF. 12" 16Ga. 730 14.60 8.15 16.30 8.50 15.25 8.50 17.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1,000 LF. 15" 16Ga. 8.80 17.60 $.80 19.60 10.00 18.35 10.2§ 20.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
500 LF. 18", 18Ca. 1085 21.80 12.20 24,40 12.00 288 1275 25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
500 LF. 21" 14 Ga. 14.70 29.40 16.35 2.7 15.50 3065 17.05 IS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
500 LF. 247, 14Ga, 16.80 33.60 18.70 37.40 18.00 35.00 19.50 40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 30", Y4 Ga. 21.00 42.00 23.35 46.70 225 43.75 24.35 50.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
300 LF. 36" 12Ga. 34.80 69.60 38.70 7140 35.90 7250 40.35 80.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
300 LF. 48", 12Ga. 46.15 92.30 51.30 10260 47.60 96.15 53.55 110.00 NO 8iD NO BiD NO BID NO BID
PP Bands/Connectors PP Bands/Connectors PP Bands/Connectors
Plastic Pipe (PP) (Per Ft)) __{Each) {Per Ft.) {Each) (Per Ft.) {Each)
1,000 LF. 12" 423 5.00 4.30 5.05 419 4.95
1,000 LF, 15 550 1175 555 11.85 5.45 8.70
500 L.F. 18" 8.23 15.05 8.30 1435 8.17 14.06
500 LF. %" 1268 20.00 13.80 20.20 1358 19.84
500 LF. 30" 20.55 5920 2075 60.00 2039 58.80
500 LF. 8" 24.830 64.50 24.90 65.45 24.65 64.14
500 LF. 42" 32.50 99.50 3260 100.75 3226 98.67
500 LF. 48" 4215 9825 4225 112.50 41.38 11021
500 L.F. 54" NO BID No BID NO 8iID NO BID NO BID NO BID
500 L.F. 60" 73.95 245.00 74.35 249.50 73.58 244.00




TABULATION OF BIDS - APRIL 3, 2019
CORRUGATED METAL BRIDGE FLOORING / BRIDGE REPLACEMENT BEAMS
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

The Ohio Bridge Corporation DBA U.S. Bridge
201 Wheeling Avenue, P.O. Box 757
Cambridge, OH 43725
(740) 421-9336

Corrugated Metal Bridge Flooring - Approx. 3,000 Sq. Ft.

Bid Bond: Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America - 5%

Panel Gauge Corrugation Width Price Bid (Per Sq. Ft.)

3 3"x9" 18" 21.00
3 3"x9" 24" No Bid
5 3x9" 18" 19.00

5 3"x9" 24" No Bid
7 2" x 6" 18" No Bid
7 2" x6" 24" No Bid
7 3"x9" 18" No Bid
7 X9 24" No Bid

Brid@placement Beams - Approx. 5,000 Lbs.

Price Bid (Per Lb.)

Steel Beams

1.59

Galvanizing

0.28




