TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 18, 2020 - VARIOUS SIZES OF SLAG
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

BID SUBMITTED BY': 3/18/2020

Delivered to

Delivered to

Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to
5000 Newton Falls Road | Various Sites 5000 Newton Falls Road | Various Sites 5000 Newton Falis Road Various Sites
F.O.B. Plant Ravenna, OH In the County [{ F.O.B. Plant Ravenna, OH In the County {| F.O.B. Plant Ravenna, OH In the County
Redland Quarries NY Inc. dba; Lafarge Great Lakes
2106 West 3rd Street
Cleveland, OH 44113
Phone: (216) 242-0988 NO BID $27.45 $27.95 ||[NOBID $24.25 $24.75 [NO BID $19.00 $19.50
Bid Bond: Westem Surety Company - 5%
Delivery: As requested
Stoneco, Inc. dba Allied Corp. Inc.
8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. Suite 120
Twinsburg, OH 44087
Phone: (330) 425-7861 NO BID $30.95 $30.95 [NOBID $32.95 $32.95 {NOBID $19.95 $19.95

Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual Insurance Company - 5%
Delivery: 24 hour notice required




TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 18,2020 - VARIOUS SIZES OF GRAVEL
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

,000

~BID SUBMITTED BY: 3/18/2020
Ray Bertolini Trucking Co.
2070 Wright Rd
Akron, OH 44320 NO BID $ 16.00 NO BID NO BID
Phone: (330) 867-0666
Bid Bond: Ohio Farmers Insurance Company - 5%

Delivery Information: 24 hours
Lakeside Sand and Gravel
3498 Frost Rd

Mantua, OH 44255 $11.75 NO BID $10.25 $10.75
Phone: (330) 274-2569

Bid Bond: Cashier's Check - $3,763.00
Delivery Information: $7.25 per ton
Central Allied Enterprise, Inc.
P.O. Box 80449

Canton, OH 44708 NO BID NO BID $ 5.00 $ 12.50
Phone: (330) 4776751

Bid Bond: Travelers Casualty & Surety Co. of America - 5%
Delivery Infformation: N/A

Ballentine Sand & Gravel LLC

7854 Cooley Rd

Ravenna, OH 44266 NO BID NO BID $ 9.00 $ 11.75
Phone: (330) 2976712

Bid Bond: Official Check - $1,037.50
Delivery Information: NA 1,000 tons : 1,000 tons




TABULATION OF BIDS - MARCH 18, 2020- VARIOUS SIZES OF LIMESTONE
PORTAGE COUNTY ENGINEER - RAVENNA, OHIO

Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to Delivered to
BID SUBMITTED BY: 3/18/2020 5000 Newton Falls Road Various Sites 5000 Newton Falls Road Various Sites 5000 Newton Falls Road Various Sites
F.0.B. Plant Ravenna, OH In the County F.0.B. Plant Ravenna, OH In the County £.0.B. Plant Ravenna, OH In the County
Fhel!y Materials, Inc. —
8920 Canyon Falls Bivd., Suite 120
Twinsburg, OH 44087
Phone: (330) 425-7861 $22.20 $25.95 $26.45 $21.75 $25.50 $26.00 $21.75 $25.50 $26.00
Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual insurance Co. - 5%
Delivery tnformation: 24 hour notice required Kent Kent Kent
Ray Bertolini Trucking Co.
2070 Wright Rd
Akron, OH 44320
Phone: (330) 867-0666 NO BID $26.60 $28.35 NO BID $26.20 $27.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Bond: Ohio Farmers Insurance Co. - 5%
Delivery Information: 24 hour notice required

B0 SUBMITTED BY: 3/118/2020

F.O.8. Plant

3o ER
Delivered to

5000 Newton Falls Road
Ravenna, OH

Delivered to
Various Sites
|n the County

F.0.B. Plant

Delivered to
5000 Newton Falls Road
Ravenna, OH

Delivered to
Various Sites
In the County

Shelly Matenals, Inc.

8920 Canyon Falis Blvd., Suite 120
Twinsburg, OH 44087

Phone: (330) 425-7861

Bid Bond: Liberty Mutual Insurance Co. - 5%
Delivery Information: 24 hour notice required

$16.75

Kent

$20.50

$21.00

$18.20

Kent

$21.95

$22.45

Ray Bertolini Trucking Co.
2070 Wright Rd

Bid Bond: Ohio Farmens Insurance Co. - 5%
Delivery Information: 24 hour notice required

NO BID

$2245

$23.95

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




